
ALL ABOUT

Mrs. Dauphin

This is my fourth consecutive year
teaching Kindergarten here at CJA but
my 9th year total working in education. I
have a love for teaching that I truly
hope I never lose. Kindergarten was my
dream job, and I feel so blessed to be
coming back for year four!
I have two boys of my own at home.
Henry is in fourth grade this year and
Jack is in sixth. They both keep us very
busy! This summer we moved into our
‘forever’ home (finally!) and after a
month of settling in, it feels good to be
getting back into a routine. I’m so
excited for this year and look forward to
sharing it with your children! Please
never hesitate to reach out via e-mail,
text, or phone call if you need anything
or just want to check in on your kiddo.
Thank you for trusting me with your
child’s education. Cheers to a great
year!

Favorites:
Drink: Iced Coffee

Candy: Reese's

Dinner: Spaghetti and garlic 

bread

Hobby: Reading

Place to shop: Barnes and 

Noble

Flower: Sunflowers and 

succulents

Movie: Anything in the 

Marvel universe

Vacation spot: Anywhere I 

can relax with a good book

Animal: Llama


