
 
 

SYNOPSIS OF THE QUARTER 3 SCHOOL PLAN 
SCHOOL: Carnahan High School of the Future 

PRINCIPAL: Jonathan Griffin, Jonathan.Griffin@slps.org  

INSTRUCTIONAL PLAN: Five-day-a-week in-person instruction or virtual learning, based on 
parent/guardian selection. When in-person, if any student violates our safety protocols, such as 
refusing to properly wear a mask, failing to follow classroom expectations, and/or any discipline 
issues, they will be moved back to virtual learning instruction full-time. 

CLASSROOM CAPACITY: Approximately 10 students. Larger classes may be held in larger spaces, 
such as the library or gym. At all times, we will follow social distancing guidelines. 

SCHOOL HOURS: 7:10AM – 1:07PM 

ARRIVAL PROCEDURE: Female and male students will enter through separate doors to keep the 
entry process smooth. All students should enter with masks properly covering their mouth and nose. 
Also, students will be expected to have their laptops fully charged before arriving to school. All 
students will complete a health screening and temperature check and then complete the normal 
entry procedure. 

DAILY HEALTH PROCEDURE: Each student will go through a health screening prior to entering the 
building. Students will be provided ample opportunities to wash hands and use hand sanitizer. 
Students must socially distance and wear masks while inside the building, unless they are eating or 
drinking at designated meal times. If students are exhibiting signs of illness (chills, shakes, muscle 
pain, sore throat, loss of taste, fever, shortness of breath, cough) or have been in contact with 
anyone diagnosed with COVID-19, they should not come to school. 

MEALS: Students will eat in designated areas while practicing social distancing. 

VISITOR PROCEDURES: Only one visitor allowed per family (No more than one member per family 
will be able to enter). Only one visitor in the building at a time (All other visitors will wait in car until 
called in by member of Carnahan team). All appointments with administration, counselors, etc. must 
be arranged prior to arrival. All visitors who enter the front of the building will be expected to sanitize 
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and get their temperature checked. If temperature is outside of the safe zone, they will not be 
allowed inside of the building. 

DISMISSAL PROCEDURE: Students who ride the bus will be dismissed by cohorts (designated 
groups). Students who get picked up will wait in a designated area while their ride will pick up from 
staff parking lot. Students who walk will be dismissed last. 

WHOM CAN I CONTACT FOR A MORE DETAILED PLAN: Principal Jonathan Griffin at 314-437-1814 
or Jonathan.Griffin@slps.org.  
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